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Problem Statement 

A patient with diabetes suffers from erectile dysfunction. 
We had 3 patients reported erectile dysfunction problem 
due to their high glucose level and thyroid problems. 
 
This is the article on erectile dysfunction. Erectile 
dysfunction (ED) is a condition that affects 100 million 
men worldwide. This is a condition shrouded in secrecy, 
and the vast majorities of men who have ED never speak 
or seek any treatment. This disease is a highly prevalent 
with a significant impact on men’s health and psychology. 
If it is not treated, it will have serious repercussion on 
relationship with their dear ones (spouse or girl 
friend/sexual partner). In many cases, majority of the 
men become jealous about their partner/spouse and 
doubting their partners eventually it might lead to a 
deadly psychological disease called “Schizophrenia”. A 
high level of chemical imbalance (dopamine level) in our 
brain takes the toll for these kinds of patients. Most of the 
people think that there may not be permanent cure for the 
same or may be scared of negative side effects of the 
drugs to cure the disease. 
 
Erectile dysfunction (ED) is defined as persistent 
difficulty achieving and maintaining an erection sufficient 
to have sex. To maintain an erection, blood must be able 
to flow into and stay in the penis until orgasm. 
 
What are the causes for erectile dysfunction? 

a. Your sexual hormone (testosterone) imbalance or 
deficiency. 

b. Lack of blood flow in your sexual organ (a clogging of 
arteries in the penis). 

c. If you are suffering from any chronic disease (diabetes, 
heart disease, high blood pressure, thyroid, kidney 
disease, or any other psychological disease) it might 
jeopardize your sexual organ. 

d. The allopathic drugs which you are using to cure your 
above diseases are definitely a major factor for the ED. 
Also, any radiation therapy, surgery and post surgery 
medications, tranquilizers and pain killers too. 

e. Addiction to smoking, alcohol and drugs. 

f. High level of stress hormones (Cortisol) has major 
impact on your sex hormones. Your key master glad 
pituitary gland takes the master call of your ED health. 
Prolactin is the chemical from your master gland play a 
key role in erectile dysfunction. People suffering from 
hypothyrodisim need to understand here that this 
disease enhances the secretion of prolactin thereby 
impacting the sex hormones.  

 

Herbal Remedies  

Some research studies show that watermelon may have 
effects on erectile dysfunction that are similar to the ED 
drug Viagra and may also increase sexual desire. 
Watermelon is rich in beneficial ingredients known as 
phytonutrients. Phytonutrients are also antioxidants. One 
of their benefits is that they relax the blood vessels that 
supply an erection. You can also try some an aphrodisiac 
nature of spice and food such as Shell fish, Oyster and 
Ginger.  
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Methods of Healing 1 

Reiki Distant Healing given to patients for 21 days. We 
healed their psychological issues such as insomnia, stress 
and anxiety first. After healing we could see the drop 
down in their glucose level. For some patients, we healed 
their blood pressure/thyroid problems. Upon successful 
healing of these glands, hormones, we received positive 
results in erectile functioning. Till now, 3 patients 
problem on ED has been resolved. 
 

Results 

All patients recovered from Erectile Dysfunction after 
healing their glucose level.  
 

Methods of Healing 2 

Mexican Healing given to patients for 8 days. We healed 
their psychological issues such as sex phobia, insecurity, 
inferiority complex problems and other stress, anxiety 

related problems. After healing we could see the 
improvements in sexual functions.  
 

Results 

All patients recovered from Erectile Dysfunction after 
healing their sex phobia, insecurity and inferiority 
complex problems. 
 

Conclusion 

To heal any chronic diseases, we need to heal their root 
cause of the problems. Doctors need to counsel the patient 
by understanding their family history and spend time to 
heal their psychological diseases as a first step to cure 
their disease. All the key master glands, endocrine glands, 
hormones need to be healed for each of the diseases 
which patient might suffer. The healing treatment might 
take anywhere between 21 day to 63 days based on 
multiple illness of the patient. 
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